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RE: invoice template[1].doc

From: Phil Elliott <phil.elliott@riverinastrata.com.au>
To: "Cartwright, Rebecca" <rebecca.cartwright@parliament.nsw.gov.au>
Date: Tue, 04 Dec 2012 17:13:01 +1100

Hello Rebecca

That’s done now

The ANZ mucked something up which threw the whole system out so the deposit will appear
from my account..l think | used the reference ‘from Phil’

These things go overnight | think so it should be in your account tomorrow at worse

Cheers

Phil

From: Rebecca Cartwright [mailto:Rebecca.Cartwright@parliament.nsw.gov.au]
Sent: Tuesday, 4 December 2012 1:20 PM

To: Phil Elliott

Cc: Nicole Hatton

Subject: Re: invoice template[1].doc

Hi Phil,
The lady wants cash of course which is fine so can you pay my account:

Bankwest - bsb 302-100 account number-359 name Rebecca Cartwright name of account
Bankwest Zero Transaction account.

Cheers for that I'm going to the bank now to withdraw the cash for her.

Speak to you soon.

Becky

>>> Phil Elliott <phil.elliott@riverinastrata.com.au> 12/4/2012 1:03 pm >>>

Hello Nicole

Just had a chat to Rebecca . I can transfer to ladies account of if she wants cash I will transfer to one
of your accounts and you could withdraw funds

Cheers

Phil

Sent from my iPhone

On 04/12/2012, at 12:15 PM, "Nicole Hatton" <Nicole.Hatton@parliament.nsw.gov.au> wrote:
> Hi Phil,

>

> Remember last week we had a payment of $1000 for the china dinner, that in the end did not take
place.... I banked the funds into the G8way bank account on Friday am.
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> The women is now wanting her money refunded. How is the best way to handle this?

>
> Thanks
> Nicole

VVVYV

> >>> "Phil Elliott" <phil.elliott@riverinastrata.com.au> 11/29/2012 3:15 pm >>>
> Thanks Nicole

>

> Perfect

> The only thing we need to do is include an address of the payer

>

> Thanks again

> Phil

>

> ----- Original Message-----

> From: Nicole Hatton [mailto:Nicole.Hatton@parliament.nsw.gov.au]
> Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2012 2:44 PM

> To: nicole@g8wayinternational.com.au; Phil Elliott

> Subject: invoice template[1].doc

>

> Copy of invoice for dinner - $1000

>

> Nicole

>

>
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